
 

 

 

KS2 MATHS HOMEWORK MENU  -  Spring 1 Year 3  

Choose one activity to complete each week.  Tick in the box when completed (Highlighted box – ICT links)                                              

How many pennies in a pound?  
Can you collect some shopping 
receipts and create your own 
addition and subtraction money 
word problems?  
I went to the shops and spent 
£3.50. I paid with £5. How 
much change was I given?   
 

How many ways can you make 
100 by adding two numbers 
together?  
 E.G.  
36+64 
29 + 71 
Can you now make 100 by 
adding three numbers together? 

Revise the 2, 4 and 8 times tables 
and derive division facts. Can you 
make a note of the patterns that 
you see? 

 How many 2s, 4s, 5s and 10s are 
there in 100? Draw a 100 square, 
which other times tables can you 
fit in your 100 squares? 

Think of a 2-digit number less 
than 50 and times it by 2, 4 
and 8.  
For example 
32 x 2 = 
32 x 4 = 
32 x 8 = 
 
 
 
 
 

Complete Mathletics activity  
Multiply and Divide – Grouping in 
Eights 
 
https://www.mathletics.com/uk/  
 
Note the date you completed this 
activity in your homework book. 

Complete Mathletics activity  
Related Facts 2 
 
https://www.mathletics.com/uk/ 
 
Note the date you completed this 
activity in your homework book. 

 
Don’t forget to use these links at 
least once a week each. 
 
https://ttrockstars.com/ 
https://www.mathletics.com/uk/  
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